
 

This is for people that do not have time to watch yevadu movie in telugu. yevadu telugu movie dubbed in hindi free download
This post is for people who don't have time to watch the film, but want to know what it's about. We are providing simply a plot
synopsis so you can decide if you would be interested in watching it. If you're interested, you'll find the direct download link at
the end of this post. The plot synopsis reveals that the film revolves around an honest detective inspector called Shiva Kumar
(Naga Chaitanya) who goes undercover as Chandrasekar, a hardcore criminal with a well-known reputation of never getting
caught. Posing as a kingpin in a highly illegal drug-ring, he enters into an undercover operation to get evidence against the head
of the gang. To get close enough to this notorious criminal, Shiva Kumar is forced to move into his house and pretend to be his
son. During his stay, he also falls in love with a young girl who works in the house and is the only daughter of a local gun-mata
(known as a 'Pattam') who has been protecting this criminal's life for many years. The daughter's name is Rajini (Charleena
Bhattacharya) . The detective inspector is assisted by his friend (Ajay) in putting together the evidence against the criminal
kingpin, who currently has police protection after being arrested. Shiva Kumar's mission is to uncover all the details which will
lead him to busting up this gang. But, when he comes close to committing the ultimate sin--betraying his family for this
mission--he is forced into an impossible decision. The entire film revolves around that decision.

The film released on 27 July in over 800 theatres across in 7 languages-Tamil, Telugu, Hindi, Malayam, Kannada and Tulu. The
film's first-day gross was . This was the highest first-day collection of all Chaitanya's films till date. 'Yevadu' had a very healthy
opening day, registering more than 300 K100 crore, which was again the highest opening day figures of his career. After its first-
day performance, many people had some doubts towards the film's two new songs that were added into the Telugu version.
Though they failed to match up to the spectacular result that Chaitanya and team got with 'Naan Nadhi Theruvu', one doesn't
doubt their work and simply appreciate Chaitanya and his directorial prowess. The film collected in its first week. 'Yevadu'
collected around 1.40 billion Sunday box office collection. The film was declared as a 'Blockbuster' at the box office with 1
crore business on Monday. "Yevadu" received generally positive reviews from critics at the time of release. "Behindwoods"
rated it 3/5 and stated that "the first half is an entertaining commercial entertainer, while the second part is much more serious
but satisfying to watch". Times Now rated it 3/5 and stated that "It's a commercial entertainer with some weighty content".
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